KARNES COUNTY SURPLUS BID AUCTION APPARENT HIGH BIDDERS

Item Description Minimum Bid Winning Bid Apparent High Bidder(s)
EMS1 2012 Chevy 2500 Duramax Chassis - 152,257 Miles None $5,123.00 Evangeline Skloss
EMS2 2005 Chevy Duramax Wheeled Coach Ambulance - 89,115 Miles $4,000.00 $5,123.00 Evangeline Skloss
RB1 John Deere 650) Dozer with 1,689 Hours $60,000.00 $69,551.00 Lailey Sczepanik
RB2 Case 5805K Back Hoe with 6,799 Hours $3,000.00 $7,651.00 Jens Jorritsma
RB3 2004 Massey Ferguson Model 492 Farm Tractor with 5,925 Hours $7,500.00 $10,521.00 Mike & Katie Knight
RB4 John Deere 50 Series Farm Tractor with 3-Point Shredder with 5,067 Hours $3,500.00 $5,001.00 Homer Rios
RB5 Bush Hog 2610L 10' Shredder $100.00 $305.00 Evangeline Skloss
RB6 John Deere 8' Shredder (Pull Behind) $2,000.00 $3,010.01 Larry Yaskow
RB7 John Deere 8' Shredder (Pull Behind) $2,000.00 $2,810.00 Larry Yaskow
Tie bet Scott Allen Hart d
RBS 1998 GMC Sierra 1500 Pickup Truck with 264,719 Miles (Fuel Tank Not Included) $500.00 $650.00 e between Scott Allen Hartman an
Robert Sczepanik
RB9 2002 Chevy 1500 Pickup Truck with 154,419 Miles (Fuel Tank Not Included) $1,500.00 $2,500.00 Clarence Moczygemba
2005 Ch 1500 4X4 Ci Cab Pickup Truck with 242,550 Mil Fuel Tank Not
RB10 A/ rew Lab Fickup Jruck wi g IESUAERCD $2,500.00 $3,150.00 Tobin Sczepanik
Included)
RB11 2004 Nissan Pickup Truck with 175,932 Miles $3,500.00 No Bid Recieved No Bid Received
Min. Bid Not Met
RB12 100 Gallon Capacity Pickup Truck Fuel Tank (No Pump) $100.00 (Hi;\ Bild " 375.30) Ronnie Stolle
RB13 100 Gallon Capacity Pickup Truck Fuel Tank with Tool Box and 12 Volt Pump $130.00 $150.00 Jack Crow
RB14 100 Gallon Capacity Pickup Truck Fuel Tank with 12 Volt Pump $120.00 $305.00 Kirk Sczepanik
RB15 100 Gallon Capacity Pickup Truck Fuel Tank with 12 Volt Pump $1,000.00 $3,010.00 Irby McCarley Jr.
RB16 1 Heavy Pipe Cattle Guard (16' x 8') $800.00 $881.00 Mike & Katie Knight
RB17 4 Light Pipe Cattle Guards (Various Sizes from 10' to 13" wide) $800.00 $899.01 Larry Yaskow
2004, Blue Dodge 1500 pickup, in good condition, needs a battery and last six of . . .
SD1 e $1,500.00 $2,457.00 Mike & Katie Knight
D2 .2000 Grey Chevrolet Tahoe, in good condition, needs a battery and last six of VIN $1,500.00 No Bid Recieved No Bid Received
is 1107782
D3 2013 Black Dodge Charger, in fair condition, needs a battery, and last six of VIN is $2,500.00 $3,150.00 Yousef Dabbagh
H694915
SD4 2014 white Chevrolet Tahoe, in good condition, last six of VIN is R201685 $4,000.00 $4,250.00 Yousef Dabbagh
2014 Brown Chevrolet 1500 pickup, in fair condition (AC does not work and needs . . .
SD5 2,500.00 4,481.00 Mike & Katie Knight
a battery), last six of VIN 7219393 52, 54 fxe & RatieRnig
SD6 2014 White Chevrolet Tahoe, in good condition, last six of VIN is R188521 $4,000.00 $4,250.00 Yousef Dabbagh
2016 White Chevrolet Tahoe, in fair condition, (motor is missing and needs work) .
sSD7 A — $2,500.00 $5,123.00 Evangeline Skloss
2015 Brown Chevrolet Silverado crew cab pickup, in fair condition (motor has a .
SD8 2,500.00 7,707. E line Skl
dead cylinder and needs work) last 6 of VIN is G186508 52, e vangeline Sxoss
D9 Compu‘ter equipment, to include 9 towers, 7 monitors, 10 key boards, and 5 None No Bid Recieved No Bid Received
mouse's
SD10 30 Getac Laptop computers, in good condition, windows 7 operating system $3,000.00 No Bid Recieved No Bid Received

***Final award recommendations to be presented to Commissioner Court on February 9, 2021....



